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I support

Sensible redevelopment of redundant
Brownfield land.

Conservation of the historic natural and built
environment.

A better social, economic and housing tenure
balance.

Small scale settlements – such as originally
suggested for Highnam.

Maintenance of the ecology and biodiversity of
the area.
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Infrastructure improvements prior to
development – i.e. schools, doctors, dentists,
traffic open space, local facilities.

Local green space/green buffering.

Zero carbon building standards.

Better public transport to reduce car
dependency – including;

Park & Rides at Brockworth/ Shurdington, and
Uckington.

Light rail/tram link.

Junction 10 upgrade to four-way.

Local Bus services.

Meeting any demand for more local jobs.

A fair say in our future.

I oppose

The JCS area overall housing numbers.

Cheltenham’s overall housing number.

Up Hatherley Way and Chargrove Lane
proposed development.

Development of valued or productive
Greenfield land.

Harm to the historic natural and built
environment.

Threats to the ecology and biodiversity of the
area.
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Sensible redevelopment of redundant
Brownfield land.

Conservation of the historic natural and built
environment.

A better social, economic and housing tenure
balance.

Small scale settlements – such as originally
suggested for Highnam.

Maintenance of the ecology and biodiversity of
the area.

Infrastructure improvements prior to
development – i.e. schools, doctors, dentists,
traffic open space, local facilities.

Local green space/green buffering.
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Zero carbon building standards.

Better public transport to reduce car
dependency – including;

Park & Rides at Brockworth/ Shurdington, and
Uckington.

Light rail/tram link.

Junction 10 upgrade to four-way.

Local Bus services.

Meeting any demand for more local jobs.

A fair say in our future.

I oppose

The JCS area overall housing numbers.

Cheltenham’s overall housing number.

Up Hatherley Way and Chargrove Lane
proposed development.

Development of valued or productive
Greenfield land.

Harm to the historic natural and built
environment.

Threats to the ecology and biodiversity of the
area.
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Sensible redevelopment of redundant
Brownfield land.

Conservation of the historic natural and built
environment.

A better social, economic and housing tenure
balance.

Small scale settlements – such as originally
suggested for Highnam.

Maintenance of the ecology and biodiversity of
the area.

Infrastructure improvements prior to
development – i.e. schools, doctors, dentists,
traffic open space, local facilities.

Local green space/green buffering.
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Zero carbon building standards.

Better public transport to reduce car
dependency – including;

Park & Rides at Brockworth/ Shurdington, and
Uckington.

Light rail/tram link.

Junction 10 upgrade to four-way.

Local Bus services.

Meeting any demand for more local jobs.

A fair say in our future.

I oppose

The JCS area overall housing numbers.

Cheltenham’s overall housing number.

Up Hatherley Way and Chargrove Lane
proposed development.

Development of valued or productive
Greenfield land.

Harm to the historic natural and built
environment.

Threats to the ecology and biodiversity of the
area.
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Sensible redevelopment of redundant
Brownfield land.

Conservation of the historic natural and built
environment.

A better social, economic and housing tenure
balance.

Small scale settlements – such as originally
suggested for Highnam.

Maintenance of the ecology and biodiversity of
the area.

Infrastructure improvements prior to
development – i.e. schools, doctors, dentists,
traffic open space, local facilities.
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Local green space/green buffering.

Zero carbon building standards.

Better public transport to reduce car
dependency – including;

Park & Rides at Brockworth/ Shurdington, and
Uckington.

Light rail/tram link.

Junction 10 upgrade to four-way.

Local Bus services.

Meeting any demand for more local jobs.

A fair say in our future.

I oppose

The JCS area overall housing numbers.

Cheltenham’s overall housing number.

Up Hatherley Way and Chargrove Lane
proposed development.

Development of valued or productive
Greenfield land.

Harm to the historic natural and built
environment.

Threats to the ecology and biodiversity of the
area.
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